
 
 
 

  

 
 

   

 

Date Event Summary Supporter  

event 

Fundraising 

event 

April 

Wednesday 17 

April 

6pm 

42 Balloons 

Dress Rehearsal 

42 Balloons is an uplifting musical 
inspired by the highly improbable 
true story of how Larry, and his 
partner Carol Van Deusen, 
convinced their friends and family 
to help Larry achieve his dream of 
flying. Join us for an exclusive 
sneak preview of the dress 
rehearsal of this exciting new 
Lowry co- production. 

Free to 

attend. Need 

to be booked 

by RSVP. 

Capacity is 

limited and 

will only 

involve a 

section of the 

show. 

 

 

June 

Thursday 6 June 

6pm 

LS Lowry 

Collection 

Rehang 

Join us in the Andrew and Zoë Law 
Galleries to celebrate the 
rehanging of the LS Lowry 
Collection. 
 

  

Saturday 15 & 

Sunday 16 June 

We Invented The 

Weekend  

We Invented the Weekend, the 
bold and imaginative free festival 
for the UK held across Salford 
Quays, will be returning to Greater 
Manchester in 2024. Including lots 
of music, theatre, sport, 
workshops, dancing, laughs, and 
more to celebrate the joy of free 
time. 
 

Free to 

attend. 

 

 

Thursday 27 

June 

5:30pm 

Coram Boy: Q&A 

with the Cast 

Lowry Senior 

Programmer/Producer, Matthew 

Eames will be In Conversation with 

some of the cast of Coram Boy in 

the Lyric before the performance, 

giving you an exclusive insight into 

Free to 

attend. Show 

tickets 

included 
 



 
 
 

  

 
 

   

 

Helen Edmundson’s adaptation of   

this moving and richly colourful 

tale of 18th century England. 

 

(limited 

capacity) 

July 

Wednesday 3 

July 

 

Evening - time 

tbc 

Arts for Social 

Change 

Showcase  

Join us to celebrate the 

achievements of young people 

from across our Arts For Social 

Change & Youth Employability & 

Skills programmes. An evening of 

visual art, films, poetry and 

performance by young carers, care 

experienced young people, young 

parents and young people at risk of 

homelessness. 

 

Free to 

attend. Need 

to be booked 

by RSVP. 

 

Thursday 4 

July 

The Lowry’s 19th 

Annual Charity 

Golf Day   

Join us at Dunham Forest for our 

annual fundraising Golf Day. Teams 

cost £800. 
 ✓ 

Thursday 18 

July 

 

Evening - time 

tbc 

 

Queens 

Exhibition 

Private View 

A family exhibition celebrating the 

Queen in all of us, inspired by Six 

The Musical, written by Toby 

Marlow and Lucy Moss and now a 

global phenomenon.  

Six first came to The Lowry at 

Christmas 2018, at the end of Six’s 

first ever UK tour, and the 

production has returned regularly 

ever since, with sold-out audiences 

every time. 

Now The Lowry wants to celebrate 

not only Six, but also its glorious 

inclusivity, attitude and creativity.  

Free to 

attend. Need 

to be booked 

by RSVP. 

 



 
 
 

  

 
 

   

 

It will be an exhibition like no 

other!  

Monday 22  

July 

 

Time tbc. 

Stage Directions 

Showcase 

Stage Directions brings together 

children from aged 8-18 to 

imagine, stage and even stage 

manage a production. Come join us 

to watch the culmination of all 

their work as they stage their 

summer show at The Lowry.  

 

Free to 

attend. Need 

to be booked 

by RSVP. 

 

Thursday 25 

July  

A Chorus Line 

Gala  

Join us for an exclusive gala to 

celebrate A Chorus Line. Tickets are 

£195 each, £1850 per table of ten 

or £2,250 for a VIP table of 10. 

 ✓ 

 

More events to be announced. E-tickets to be sent in advance. 

To RSVP or book please contact naomi.gourley@thelowry.com 

mailto:.tait@thelowry.com

